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Requiring a minimal amount of equipment, feed, and care, rabbits are ideal livestock for yielding a relatively
large quantity of nutritious, savory meat.

Written by an experienced rabbit raiser, Raising Rabbits is a practical guide on maintaining a small herd for
meat and manure. Great for beginners, this book is especially useful to those who wish to produce most or all
of their own food from this valuable livestock. Ann Kanable debunks common misconceptions and instructs
on comprehensive rabbit care including:

Building inexpensive, durable housing●

Equipping the rabbitry●

Selecting proper stock for food-raising purposes●

How and what to feed your rabbits●

Maintaining rabbit health●

Handling disease with folk and veterinary medicines●

Harvesting your rabbits for food, fur, and garden fertilizer●

Keeping in mind that no two herds are alike, Kanable tailors solutions to address variables such as location,
weather conditions, and your herd's physical requirements. As rabbits are one of the most easily stressed
livestock species, this book offers advice on treating behavioral issues and a variety of ailments.

Ideal for those considering producing their own food, Raising Rabbits demonstrates how to get the most out
of your herd.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Gans:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the guide untitled Raising Rabbits can be great book to read. May be it may be
best activity to you.

Donna Bradford:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get wide range of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
book you have read will be Raising Rabbits.

Linda Mays:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book especially book entitled
Raising Rabbits the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe not
known for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a publication
then become one type conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get previous to. The Raising
Rabbits giving you one more experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful
info for your better life with this era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern this is your body and
mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Sandra Mendoza:

You could spend your free time to read this book this book. This Raising Rabbits is simple to deliver you can
read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not get much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save typically
the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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