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This is a NAVAL POSTGRADUATE SCHOOL MONTEREY CA report procured by the Pentagon and
made available for public release. It has been reproduced in the best form available to the Pentagon. It is not
spiral-bound, but rather assembled with Velobinding in a soft, white linen cover. The Storming Media report
number is A541053. The abstract provided by the Pentagon follows: The purpose of this thesis is to
determine the barriers to more active contractor participation in the DOD Value Engineering (VE) program.
A review of professional literature such as DOD Inspector General, General Accounting Office, and other
research reports provide the background information necessary to explain potential barriers to more active
contractor participation in the DOD VE program. Thirty telephone surveys were conducted with Government
and contractor personnel to solicit the opinions of these acquisition professionals concerning barriers to more
active contractor participation in the DOD VE Program. The results and analysis of the interviews are
reported. It was concluded that there are four significant barriers preventing more active contractor
participation in the DOD VE program. The four significant barriers to more active contractor participation in
the DOD VE program are insufficient funding, the VECP submission and approval process, a low level of
VE awareness among acquisition professionals, and a lack of support for the VE program among top-level
DOD management. Recommendations to improve contractor participation in VE are establishment of a
centrally managed VE fund, streamlining the VECP process, increased VE awareness training, additional VE
personnel resources, enforcement of VE savings goals, and greater top-level management support.
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From reader reviews:

Dennis Scott:

The book Barriers to More Active Contractor Participation in the Department of Defense Value Engineering
Program can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why
then must we leave the good thing like a book Barriers to More Active Contractor Participation in the
Department of Defense Value Engineering Program? Several of you have a different opinion about reserve.
But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along
with your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible to
share all of these. Book Barriers to More Active Contractor Participation in the Department of Defense
Value Engineering Program has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive function for you.
You can look the enormous world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Geraldine Bagley:

Typically the book Barriers to More Active Contractor Participation in the Department of Defense Value
Engineering Program has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The
book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research previous to write this
book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after reading this book.

Phillip Darrah:

Precisely why? Because this Barriers to More Active Contractor Participation in the Department of Defense
Value Engineering Program is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap it but
latter it will surprise you with the secret this inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who
write the book in such remarkable way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining way but
still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you
going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book have such as help
improving your proficiency and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold off having that book?
If I ended up you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Joel Padilla:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Barriers to More Active Contractor
Participation in the Department of Defense Value Engineering Program book written by well-known writer
who knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written in
good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your hunger then
you still hesitation Barriers to More Active Contractor Participation in the Department of Defense Value
Engineering Program as good book not simply by the cover but also from the content. This is one guide that
can break don't assess book by its include, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this!? Oh
come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.
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