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Delightful Homeschooling Curriculum for Older Elementary Level Students

Your curious student can study up to 20 different interesting and relevant topics

What will your child choose? Here is a list of 20 Topics that a creative thinking 10 year old might choose to
dig into: butterflies, Animals, Horse Training, Travel, Fashion, Cooking, Minecraft, Gardening, Water
Sports, Pioneers, Coin Collecting, Roman Costumes, Designing Houses, Sea Creatures, London,
Experiments, Calligraphy, Light, Sound, Electricity... With this book they can STUDY ANYTHING!

This is our most challenging Homeschooling Journal for 3rd, 4th and 5th grade students. The child must be
able to read on a 3rd grade level. Parents will need to assist the student for the first three days of learning,
and then the student will be able to work independently. All subjects are covered, but the student must be
able to use library books and online tutorials for their research, math and history lessons.

We recommend using this workbook as a supplement for classical education or as a complete curriculum for
eclectic learners and delight directed students.

If you use 10 pages per day for about four hours of guided learning time - the book will last 6 weeks.

If you use 5 pages per day for about 2 hours - and the book will last around 12 weeks.

It will last 365 days if you use one page per day year round.

Use about 2 pages per day for a 180 day school year.

Use 10 pages per day on Mondays and Fridays if you want your kids to be really happy, and it will last the
whole year. Struggling readers and dyslexics can use this activity book with great success, but may need
extra help. They will love all the creative activities, art, logic, movies and audio books that can be part of the
plan!

365 Creative Learning Pages for Christian Families

When this book is completed it will be a beautiful portfolio and keepsake for your child to treasure.

Activities Include:



Introduction to Classical Literature

Online Math Tutorials

Copywork

Storytelling with pictures and words

Logic

Film & Documentary Study

Spelling Games

Drawing Lessons

Reading 8 (or more) Library Books chosen by the student.

Comic Creations

Social Studies & World News

Nature Study

Life Science (Animals)

History

Doodling

Listening Time (Audio Books)

Coloring with Colored Pencils

Economics - Exploring Jobs & Occupations

Bible Study

Prayer Making List

To-Do List

This Activity Book has the same interior at 3rd, 4th & 5th Grade Fun-Schooling Journal
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From reader reviews:

Randy Garrison:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Ages 9 to 12 - Fun-Schooling Journal - For
Christian Families: Study 20 Interesting and Relevant Topics 365 Creative Learning Activities De (Home
Learning Guides) (Volume 9) as your daily resource information.

Kerry Erdman:

The actual book Ages 9 to 12 - Fun-Schooling Journal - For Christian Families: Study 20 Interesting and
Relevant Topics 365 Creative Learning Activities De (Home Learning Guides) (Volume 9) will bring you to
the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event
you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Ages 9 to 12 - Fun-Schooling
Journal - For Christian Families: Study 20 Interesting and Relevant Topics 365 Creative Learning Activities
De (Home Learning Guides) (Volume 9) is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book
from official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

John Stewart:

The reason why? Because this Ages 9 to 12 - Fun-Schooling Journal - For Christian Families: Study 20
Interesting and Relevant Topics 365 Creative Learning Activities De (Home Learning Guides) (Volume 9) is
an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap it but latter it will shock you with the
secret the item inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
wonderful way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey
the meaning totally. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to
regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book include such as help improving your
skill and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will
go to the publication store hurriedly.

Charlotte Neville:

This Ages 9 to 12 - Fun-Schooling Journal - For Christian Families: Study 20 Interesting and Relevant
Topics 365 Creative Learning Activities De (Home Learning Guides) (Volume 9) is great book for you
because the content that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have to make
decision every minute. That book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can claim



no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean
it only gives you straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences.
Having Ages 9 to 12 - Fun-Schooling Journal - For Christian Families: Study 20 Interesting and Relevant
Topics 365 Creative Learning Activities De (Home Learning Guides) (Volume 9) in your hand like finding
the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you
world in ten or fifteen second right but this reserve already do that. So , it is good reading book. Heya Mr.
and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?
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